# WATERLOO CITY COUNCIL

## Regular Meeting Agenda

Date: April 18, 2016 Time: 7:30 p.m.

- 1. <u>Call to Order</u>.
- 2. <u>Roll Call</u>.
- 3. <u>Pledge of Allegiance</u>.
- 4. <u>Correction or Withdrawal of Agenda Items by Sponsor</u>.
- 5. <u>Approval of Minutes as Written or Amended.</u>
- 6. <u>Petitions by Citizens on Non-Agenda Items</u>.
- 7. <u>Reports and Communications from the Mayor and other City Officers.</u>
  - A. Report of Collector.
  - B. Report of Treasurer.
  - C. Report of Zoning Administrator.
  - D. Report of Director of Public Works.
  - E. Report of Chief of Police.
  - F. Report of City Attorney.
  - G. Report and Communication by Mayor.
    - 1. Presentation of Certificate of Recognition to Andy Altes as Mayor for the Day.
    - 2. Reappointment of Todd Osterhage to the Police Pension Board for a Two-Year Term to Expire May 8, 2018.
- 8. <u>Report of Standing Committees</u>.
- 9. <u>Report of Special Committees</u>.
- Presentation of Communications, Petitions, Resolutions, Orders and Ordinances by Aldermen.
   A. Consideration and Action on Ordinance No. 1699 Adopting an Amended Annual Budget for the City of Waterloo, IL for the Fiscal Year of May 1, 2015 Through April 30, 2016.
- 11. <u>Unfinished Business</u>.
- 12. <u>Miscellaneous Business</u>.
  - A. Consideration and Action on Approval of Huebner Concrete Contracting as Low Bidder in the Amount of \$83,364.00 for the 2016 Street, Curb & Sidewalk Improvement Program as per the Bid Opening Held on April 12, 2016 at 2:00 p.m.
- 13. Discussion of Matters by Council Members Arising After Agenda Deadline.
- 14. <u>Motion to Adjourn</u>.

## **DATES TO REMEMBER**

April 19, 2016 – Garden Club Meeting, Waterloo City Hall: Front Conference Room, 6:30 p.m.
April 20, 2016 – Discover Historic Waterloo Meeting, Waterloo City Hall: Front Conference Room, 7:00 p.m.
April 25, 2016 – City Council Meeting, Waterloo City Hall: Council Chambers, 7:30 p.m.
April 26, 2016 – American Legion Meeting, Waterloo City Hall: Second Floor, 7:00 p.m.
May 02, 2016 – City Council Meeting, Waterloo City Hall: Council Chambers, 7:30 p.m.
May 09, 2016 – City Council Meeting, Waterloo City Hall: Council Chambers, 7:30 p.m.
May 09, 2016 – Planning Commission Meeting, Waterloo City Hall: Council Chambers, 7:00 p.m.
May 10, 2016 – Sister Cities Meeting, Waterloo City Hall: Front Conference Room, 7:00 p.m.
May 11, 2016 – Minister's Meeting, Waterloo City Hall: Second Floor, 8:00 a.m.
May 11, 2016 – Park District Meeting, Waterloo City Hall: Front Conference Room, 7:00 p.m.

## MINUTES OF THE CITY COUNCIL MEETING APRIL 04, 2016

- 1. The meeting was called to order by Mayor Tom Smith.
- 2. The following aldermen were present: Thomas, Hopkins, Trantham, Darter, Frederick, and Heller. Aldermen Notheisen and Koerber were absent.
- 3. <u>Pledge of Allegiance</u> led by Mayor Tom Smith.
- 4. <u>Correction or Withdrawal of Agenda Items by Sponsor</u>. None.
- 5. <u>Approval of Minutes as Written or Amended</u>. Motion made by Alderman Heller and seconded by Alderman Frederick to approve March 28, 2016, 7:30 p.m., City Council Meeting Minutes. Correction from the Vietnam War Proclamation the 50-year anniversary will be the last for Boots on the Ground. Motion passed unanimously with Aldermen Heller, Thomas, Hopkins, Trantham, Darter and Frederick voting yea.
- 6. <u>Petitions by Citizens on Non-Agenda Items</u>. None.
- 7. <u>Reports and Communications from the Mayor and other City Officers.</u>
  - A. <u>Report of Collector</u>. No report.
  - B. <u>Report of Treasurer</u>. No report.
  - C. <u>Report of Zoning Administrator</u>. No report.
  - D. <u>Report of Building Inspector/Code Administrator</u>. Report is in the packet.
  - E. <u>Report of Director of Public Works</u>. Tim Birk displayed a burnt tree limb which grew over a service line. He announced the annual Gas Meeting May 2, 2016, 6 p.m. at City Hall.
  - F. <u>Report of Chief of Police</u>. No report.
  - G. <u>Report of City Attorney</u>. No report.
  - H. <u>Report and Communication by Mayor</u>.
    - 1. Presentation of Commendation to Schneider Quality Meats for their 50<sup>th</sup> Anniversary. Mark Lengacher accepted the certificate and stated the business began in 1966 in Valmeyer.
- 8. <u>Report of Standing Committees</u>. No report.
- 9. <u>Report of Special Committees</u>. Shawn Kennedy met with the Bicentennial Committee Tuesday to plan events coming up in the future months and will meet with the Fair Board later.

- 10. <u>Presentation of Communications, Petitions, Resolutions, Orders and Ordinances by Aldermen.</u> No report.
- 11. <u>Unfinished Business</u>. None.
- 12. <u>Miscellaneous Business</u>.
  - A. <u>Consideration and Action on Warrant No. 540</u>.
     Motion made by Alderman Heller and seconded by Alderman Frederick to approve Warrant No. 540. Motion passed unanimously with Aldermen Heller, Thomas, Hopkins, Trantham, Darter and Frederick voting yea.
  - B. <u>Consideration and Action on Raffle License Request and Waiver of Bond from the Optimist Club of Waterloo for a Scholarship Raffle to be held on May 26, 2016, 8:00 p.m., at J.V.'s Bar & Restaurant.
    Motion made by Alderman Thomas and seconded by Alderman Heller to approve a Raffle License Request and Waiver of Bond from the Optimist Club of Waterloo for a Scholarship Raffle to be held on May 26, 2016, 8:00 p.m., at J.V.'s Bar & Restaurant.
    Motion passed unanimously with Aldermen Thomas, Hopkins, Trantham, Darter, Frederick and Heller voting yea.
    </u>
  - C. <u>Consideration and Action on Approval of Building Materials for the Stubborn German</u> <u>Brewery.</u> Motion made by Alderman Darter and seconded by Alderman Hopkins to approve building materials for the Stubborn German Brewery. Discussion. Alderman Heller stated the Downtown Beautification Committee and the Planning Commission unanimously approved this action. Motion passed unanimously with Darter, Frederick, Heller, Thomas, Hopkins and Trantham voting yea.
  - D. <u>Consideration and Action on Reappointment of Donna Robert to the Waterloo</u> <u>Cemetery Board for a Three-Year Term to Expire April 01, 2019</u>. Motion made by Alderman Trantham and seconded by Alderman Hopkins to approve the reappointment of Donna Robert to the Waterloo Cemetery Board for a three-year term to expire April 01, 2019. Motion passed unanimously with Aldermen Trantham, Darter, Frederick, Heller, Thomas and Hopkins voting yea.
  - E. Consideration and Action on Raffle License Request and Waiver of Bond from the St. Elizabeth Ann Seton Conference of the St. Vincent DePaul for a Raffle to be held at Gibault Catholic High School on April 23, 2016, 11:00 p.m. Motion made by Alderman Hopkins and seconded by Alderman Heller to approve a Raffle License Request and Waiver of Bond from the St. Elizabeth Ann Seton Conference of the St. Vincent DePaul for a Raffle to be held at Gibault Catholic High School on April 23, 2016, 11:00 p.m. Motion passed unanimously with Aldermen Hopkins, Trantham, Darter, Frederick, Heller and Thomas voting yea.
- 13. Discussion of Matters by Council Members Arising After Agenda Deadline.

**Alderman Hopkins** stated he is happy about the building materials for the Stubborn German Brewery and said it will be a nice addition.

Alderman Heller stated himself and Mayor Smith will meet with the Rogers Elementary School civics class Tuesday. They will have a mock version of a city council meeting to discuss basketball hoops in the middle of a street.

14. <u>Motion to Adjourn</u>. Motion made by Alderman Thomas and seconded by Alderman Heller to adjourn. Motion passed by unanimous voice vote. Mayor Smith adjourned the meeting at 7:45 p.m.

Barbara Pace, CITY CLERK

### CITY OF WATERLOO, ILLINOIS COLLECTION REPORT

	2014-2015 ACTUAL <u>AMOUNT</u>	2015-2016 BUDGETED <u>AMOUNT</u>	% INCREASE/ <u>DECREASE</u>	2015 <u>MARCH</u>	2016 <u>MARCH</u>	% INCREASE/ <u>DECREASE</u>	2014-2015 FISCAL <u>YTD</u>	2015-2016 FISCAL <u>YTD</u>	% INCREASE/ <u>DECREASE</u>
ELEC SALES	10,267,348.89	10,490,000.00	2.17%	969,711.11	846,373.91	-12.72%	9,496,584.67	9,647,943.13	1.59%
ELEC TAX	262,050.16			25,919.78	21,920.65	-15.43%	242,210.34	241,805.82	-0.17%
ELECT MISC.	492,660.00	239,200.00	- <u>51.45</u> %	42,518.00	18,383.00	-56.76%	456,576.00	232,308.00	- <u>49.12</u> %
SUBTOTAL	11,022,059.05	10,729,200.00	-2.66%	1,038,148.89	886,677.56	-14.59%	10,195,371.01	10,122,056.95	-0.72%
BEGINNING UNAPPLIED	319,734.31			34,210.19	50,260.50	46.92%	293,842.58	371,524.48	26.44%
UNAPPLIED CASH REC'D	116,468.70			6,258.56	6,843.14	9.34%	105,071.11	117,939.15	12.25%
UNAPPLIED DISBURSED	108,610.29			14,577.02	16,452.68	<u>12.87%</u>	87,467.89	93,435.11	<u>6.82%</u>
ENDING UNAPPLIED	327,592.72			25,891.73	40,650.96	57.00%	311,445.80	396,028.52	27.16%
	2 402 470 00	2 474 000 00	22.25%	E00 407 E7	400 404 00	00.449/	0 740 000 07	2 040 050 45	25 520/
GAS SALES GAS TAX	3,182,179.06 80,144.20	2,474,000.00	-22.25%	582,137.57 16,955.78	428,421.99 13,246.08	-26.41% -21.88%	2,748,630.37 67,035.21	2,046,950.45 56,250.04	-25.53% -16.09%
GAS MISC.	435,141.00	100,000.00	-77.02%	24,883.00	10,780.00	-21.00%	421,513.00	100,127.00	-76.25%
SUBTOTAL	3,697,464.26	2,574,000.00	-30.38%	623,976.35	452,448.07	-27.49%	3,237,178.58	2,203,327.49	-31.94%
	0.446.406.96	0 447 000 00	0.049/	101 005 55	400 047 47	44 700/	4 004 207 20	4 054 550 04	0.50%
WATER SALES WATER MISC.	2,116,126.86 272,022.00	2,117,000.00 81,200.00	0.04% -70.15%	191,085.55 <u>10,735.00</u>	162,947.47 9,711.00	-14.73% <u>-9.54%</u>	1,961,387.30 263,237.00	1,951,559.04 75,866.00	-0.50% <u>-71.18%</u>
SUBTOTAL	2,388,148.86	2,198,200.00	-7.95%	201,820.55	172,658.47	-14.45%	2,224,624.30	2,027,425.04	-8.86%
						-			
SEWER SALES SEWER MISC.	1,676,422.12 362,413.00	1,693,000.00 167,300.00	0.99% -53.84%	153,645.86 22,138.00	133,881.79 20,445.00	-12.86% -7.65%	1,549,320.80 332,255.00	1,555,133.27 162,626.00	0.38% -51.05%
SUBTOTAL	2.038.835.12	1.860.300.00	-8.76%	175.783.86	154,326.79	-12.21%	1,881,575.80	1,717,759.27	-8.71%
					101,020.10	L T			
CITY TAX	524,077.62	505,300.00	-3.58%	63,424.17	50,246.75	-20.78%	475,529.73	440,548.14	-7.36%
MISC. SUBTOTAL	<u>37,655.00</u> 561,732.62	30,700.00	<u>-18.47%</u> -4.58%	<u>5,572.00</u> 68,996.17	<u>5,490.00</u> 55,736.75	<u>-1.47%</u> -19.22%	<u>34,541.00</u> 510,070.73	32,502.00	<u>-5.90%</u> -7.26%
SUBTOTAL	301,732.02	556,000.00	-4.36%	00,990.17	55,750.75	-19.22%	510,070.75	473,050.14	-7.20%
REFUSE FEE VEHICLE STICKER	687,868.18 -	741,450.00	7.79%	63,604.94 -	60,658.00 -	-4.63%	630,935.22 -	647,533.77 -	2.63%
FINES	63,595.00	47,000.00	-26.09%	7,326.00	4,095.00	-44.10%	56,396.00	42,537.00	-24.57%
PERMITS	93,498.00	80,000.00	-14.44%	15,348.00	8,271.00	-46.11%	87,914.00	75,887.00	-13.68%
INSPECTION FEES	18,750.00	20,000.00	6.67%	1,725.00	1,050.00	-39.13%	16,650.00	17,100.00	2.70%
FRANCHISE FEES LIQUOR LICENSE	112,175.00 5,640.00	120,000.00 6,200.00	6.98% 9.93%	- 10.00	- 20.00	100.00%	112,175.00 5,640.00	120,855.00	7.74% 9.88%
INFRASTRUCTURE FEE	251,709.00	262,000.00	9.93% 4.09%	20,366.00	20.00	20.25%	233,046.00	6,197.00 248,191.00	9.88% 6.50%
HOTEL/MOTEL TAX	17,256.00	13,000.00	-24.66%	182.00	24,491.00	-100.00%	14,494.00	12,627.00	-12.88%
MISC.	158,244.00	70,370.00	-55.53%	5,209.00	5,722.00	9.85%	113,539.00	72,271.00	-36.35%
REPLACEMENT TAX	60,695.00	63,930.00	5.33%	2,530.00	3,377.00	33.48%	45,209.00	49,685.00	9.90%
COUNTY TAX	394,465.00	399,500.00	1.28%	-	-		394,465.00	399,268.00	1.22%
SALES TAX	2,140,229.00	2,200,000.00	2.79%	198,217.00	210,689.00	6.29%	1,970,301.00	2,033,826.00	3.22%
BUSINESS DISTRICT TAX	61,031.00	66,000.00	8.14%	5,788.00	8,171.00	41.17%	55,535.00	64,718.00	16.54%
VIDEO GAMING INCOME TAX	51,873.00 1,141,632.00	60,000.00 1,248,000.00	15.67% 9.32%	5,144.00 105,286.00	4,452.00 123,778.00	-13.45% 17.56%	47,189.00 1,013,415.00	54,199.00 1,150,852.00	14.86% 13.56%
SUBTOTAL	5,258,660.18	5,397,450.00	<u>9.32</u> % 2.64%	430,735.94	454,774.00	5.58%	4,796,903.22	4,995,746.77	4.15%
GUDIUTAL	3,230,000.18	5,597,400.00	2.0470	430,733.84	404,774.00	0.00%	+,100,800.22	+,333,740.77	4.1070
MOTOR FUEL TAX	336,043.00	265,500.00	-20.99%	17,626.00	21,554.00	22.29%	327,001.00	245,240.00	-25.00%
MISC	491.00	575.00	<u>17.11%</u>	34.00	156.00	<u>358.82%</u>	457.00	767.00	<u>67.83%</u>
SUBTOTAL	336,534.00	266,075.00	-20.94%	17,660.00	21,710.00	22.93%	327,458.00	246,007.00	-24.87%
UTILITY DEPOSITS	109,900.00	-		8,825.00	8,925.00	1.13%	100,300.00	111,900.00	11.57%
TOTAL DEPOSITS	25,529,802.79	23,561,225.00	-7.71%	2,572,205.32	2,214,099.78	-13.92%	23,378,552.75	22,015,211.81	-5.83%

April 18, 2016

а.

To: Mayor Tom Smith City Attorney City Aldermen

Re: Treasurer's Report

Attached, please find the March 31, 2016 Treasurer's Report for the City of Waterloo.

I welcome any questions or comments you may have about this report. I can be reached at State Bank of Waterloo weekdays from 8:00 AM - 5:00 PM. The phone number is 618-939-7194.

Sincerely, Grad A. Pspenberg Brad A Papenberg

City Treasurer

## TREASURER'S REPORT CITY OF WATERLOO For the month ending March 31, 2016

CHECKING ACCOUNT	BEGINNING BALANCE	RECEIPTS	DISBURSEMENTS	ENDING BALANCE
Petty Cash	\$ 497.98	\$-	\$ -	\$ 497.98
Utility Deposit	61,648.17	8,925.00	11,625.00	58,948.17
General Fund	(802,631.57)	1,678,874.18	407,079.00	469,163.61
Motor Fuel Tax	37,557.94	22.87	12,776.43	24,804.38
Water Fund	462,789.16	173,408.55	119,970.10	516,227.61
Sewer Fund	418,230.91	155,606.43	111,150.93	462,686.41
Gas Fund	622,007.06	624,386.02	283,868.91	962,524.17
Electric Fund	794,948.80	896,822.27	837,812.27	853,958.80
Capital Improvements	174,740.75	53,805.52	-	228,546.27
D.A.R.E.	544.60	2,500.00	-	3,044.60
Interest	3,237.38	1,689.42		4,926.80
Hotel/Motel Tax	89,782.48	-	285.00	89,497.48
TOTALS:	\$1,863,353.66	\$3,596,040.26	\$1,784,567.64	\$3,674,826.28
	_			
Capital Improvements	\$ 2,240,905.99	3,487.79	-	\$ 2,244,393.78
Electric	\$ 2,937,894.34	4,572.60	-	2,942,466.94
E-Pay Utility Bills	19,496.91	21,962.69	37,823.20	3,636.40
Farm Account Income	110,994.13	14.14	-	111,008.27
Gas	3,360,515.62	5,230.38	-	3,365,746.00
General Fund	7,748,464.05	374,080.24	1,500,000.00	6,622,544.29
Motor Fuel	570,280.35	21,687.20	-	591,967.55
Pension Reserve	823,311.68	174.33	-	823,486.01
Sewer	1,474,328.52	2,294.68	-	1,476,623.20
Utility Deposits	302,653.62	471.06	-	303,124.68
Water	1,537,287.34	2,392.66	-	1,539,680.00
Total Invested Funds:	\$21,126,132.55	\$436,367.77	\$1,537,823.20	\$20,024,677.12
Total All City Funds:	\$22,989,486.21	\$4,032,408.03	\$3,322,390.84	\$23,699,503.40

Debt and Pension Obligations	Date Opened	Original Balance	Current Balance	Rate	Payment Dates
IEPA Sewer Loan Unfunded Actuarial Accrued Liability - IMRF Unfunded Actuarial Accrued Liability - Police	5/24/2007	\$12,372,060.00	\$7,721,345.00 \$1,740,126.00 \$3,042,048.00	2.50%	Jan and July
Total Liabilities		\$12,372,060.00	\$12,503,519.00		

Respectfully Submitted Papenberd 12 s.eX Brad A. Papenberg

.

Brad A. Papenberg City Treasurer

Agenda Item No. 7G1

## AGENDA REQUEST

(Submit by 12:00 p.m. on Wednesday before the meeting date requested.)

Request is made for placement on the agenda for meeting to be held on: 1. April 18, 2016 Description of matter to be placed on agenda: 2. Presentation of Certificate of Recognition to Andy Altes as Mayor for the Day. 3. Relief or action to be requested: Presentation of Certificate. Submittal date: 04-14-16 4. Submitted by: Mayor Tom Smith **DISPOSITION** Matter to be placed on agenda for meeting date requested. 5. Matter to be placed on agenda for meeting to be held on Matter referred to

<u>Mayor</u>

AGENDA REQUEST (Submit by 12:00 p.m. on Wednesday before the meeting date requested.)

Reque	est is made for placement on the agenda for meeting to be held on: April 18, 2016
Descr	iption of matter to be placed on agenda:
	pointment of Todd Osterhage to the Police Pension Board for a Two-Year
	to Expire May 8, 2018.
<u></u>	
Relief	for action to be requested:
	rmation of Reappointment.
Subm	ittal date: 03-31-16
Subm	itted by:
	r Tom Smith
	DISPOSITION
	Matter to be placed on agenda for meeting date requested.
	Notice to be also and an example for mosting to be hold on
	Matter to be placed on agenda for meeting to be held on
	Matter referred to

Mayor

Agenda Item No. 10A

<u>AGENDA REQUEST</u> (Submit by 12:00 p.m. on Wednesday before the meeting date requested.)

Request is made for placement on the agenda for meeting to be held on: 1.

	April 18, 2016
<b>m</b>	(Jane)
	tion of matter to be placed on agenda:
Conside	ration and Action on Ordinance No. 1699 Adopting an Amended Annua
	for the City of Waterloo, IL for the Fiscal Year of May 1, 2015 Through
April 30	), 2016.
Relief o	r action to be requested:
Approva	-
<u> </u>	
Submitt	al date: 04-14-16
G 1 14	11
Submitt	•
Shawn l	Kennedy, Collector / Budget Officer
	DISPOSITION
	Matter to be placed on agenda for meeting date requested.
	Matter to be placed on agenda for meeting to be held on
	Matter referred to

A Mayor

## **ORDINANCE NO. 1699**

# AN ORDINANCE ADOPTING AN AMENDED ANNUAL BUDGET FOR THE CITY OF WATERLOO, ILLINOIS FOR THE FISCAL YEAR OF MAY 1, 2015 THROUGH APRIL 30, 2016.

WHEREAS, an Annual Budget was adopted by the City Council of the City of Waterloo, Illinois for the fiscal year of May 1, 2015 through April 30, 2016 on April 27, 2015 by Ordinance No. 1681; and,

WHEREAS, it is necessary to amend the Annual Budget for the fiscal year of May 1, 2015 through April 30, 2016; and

WHEREAS, the changes that are required at this time can more appropriately be stated by a restatement in the form of the Amended Annual Budget for the fiscal year May 1, 2015 through April 30, 2016 as attached hereto as Exhibit 1.

**NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED** by the City Council of the City of Waterloo, Illinois as follows:

**SECTION ONE.** The Annual Budget for the City of Waterloo, Illinois for the fiscal year of May 1, 2015 through April 30, 2016 is hereby amended and restated in its entirety to read as set forth in Exhibit 1 attached hereto and entitled "City of Waterloo, Illinois Amended Budget 2015-2016", and the aforementioned Exhibit 1 is hereby adopted as the Amended Annual Budget of the City of Waterloo, Illinois for the fiscal year of May 1, 2015 through April 30, 2016.

**SECTION TWO. Repeal.** All ordinances or parts thereof in conflict with the provisions of this Ordinance are hereby repealed to the extent of such conflict.

**SECTION THREE. Effective Date.** This Ordinance shall take effect upon its passage and approval and shall be published in pamphlet form as provided by law.

**PASSED** this 18<sup>th</sup> day of April, 2016, pursuant to a roll call vote as follows:

YEAS:

NAYS:

ABSENT:

ABSTENTION:

Please see City Hall for a copy of Exhibit 1

<u>AGENDA REQUEST</u> (Submit by 12:00 p.m. on Wednesday before the meeting date requested.)

Request is made for placement on the agenda for meeting to be held on: April 18, 2016
Description of matter to be placed on agenda: Consideration and Action on Approval of Huebner Concrete Contracting as Low Bidder in the Amount of \$83,364.00 for the 2016 Street, Curb & Sidewalk Improvement Program as per the Bid Opening Held on April 12, 2016 at 2:00 p.m.
Relief or action to be requested: Approval.
Submittal date:       04-12-16         Submitted by:
DISPOSITION
Matter to be placed on agenda for meeting date requested.
Matter to be placed on agenda for meeting to be held on
Matter referred to
Mayor



# CITY OF WATERLOO, IL – BID OPENING RESULTS

NAM	ME OF PROJECT: 2016 Street, Curb & Side	16 Street, Curb & Sidewalk Improvement Program					
DAT	E: April 12, 2016	TIME	:: 2:00 p.m.				
	NAME OF BIDDER:		AMOUNT OF BID:				
1.	Huebner Concrete Contracting	1.	\$83,364.00				
2.	Henke Excavating, Inc.	2.	\$95,425.00				
3.		3.					
4.		4.					
5.		5.					
6.		6.					

# **City of Waterloo Sidewalk Improvement Programs**

## 4" Concrete Sidewalk Replacement (LESS than 100 sq. ft.)

	2007	\$5.40	2008	\$5.00	2014	\$4.08			
	2006	\$5.40	2009	\$5.02	2015	\$3.63			
	2005	\$5.40	2010	\$4.45	2016	\$3.45			
	2004	\$5.40	2011	\$4.30					
	2003	\$5.62	2012	\$5.90					
	2002	\$5.62	2013	\$4.50					
	2002	Ψ <b>0</b> .02	2010	Ψ1.00					
4" Cone	crete Sic	lewalk Replacem	ent (GRE	ATER than 100 s	q. ft.)				
	2007	\$4.35	2008	\$4.13	2014	\$3.10			
	2006	\$4.50	2009	\$3.88	2015	\$2.76			
	2005	\$4.35	2010	\$3.40	2016	\$2.62			
	2004	\$4.28	2011	\$3.60					
	2003	\$4.50	2012	\$5.25					
	2002	\$4.50	2013	\$3.40					
	2002	<b>\$1.00</b>		<b>40.10</b>					
6" Cone	crete Sic	lewalk Replacem	ent (LES	S than 100 sq. ft.	)				
	2007	\$5.40	2008	\$5.00	2014	\$4.08			
	2006	\$5.40	2009	\$5.02	2015	\$3,63			
	2005	\$5.40	2000	\$4.45	2016	\$3.45			
	2003	\$5.40	2010	\$4.30	2010	ψ0.40			
	2003	\$5.62	2012	\$5.96					
	2002	\$5.62	2013	\$4.50					
6" Cond	crete Sic	lewalk Replacem	ent (GRE	ATER than 100 s	q. ft.)				
	2007	\$4.35	2008	\$4.13	2014	\$3.10			
	2006	\$4.50	2009	\$3.88	2015	\$2.76			
	2005	\$4.35	2005	\$3.40	2016	\$2.62			
	2003				2010	φ2.0Z			
		\$4.28	2011	\$3.60					
	2003	\$4.50	2012	\$5.25					
Curb &	2003 2002	\$4.50	2012	\$5.25 \$3.40					
Curb &	2003 2002 Gutter F	\$4.50 \$4.50 Replacement	2012 2013 <b>Per Fo</b>	\$5.25 \$3.40 ot			Greater	Than 250 Lin. Et	
Curb &	2003 2002 Gutter F 2007	\$4.50 \$4.50 <b>Replacement</b> \$19.68	2012 2013 <b>Per Fo</b> o Less Th	\$5.25 \$3.40 ot nan 250 Lin Ft.	¢12 20			Than 250 Lin. Ft.	\$12.02
Curb &	2003 2002 Gutter F 2007 2006	\$4.50 \$4.50 <b>Replacement</b> \$19.68 \$23.50	2012 2013 <b>Per Fo</b> <u>Less TI</u> 2008	\$5.25 \$3.40 ot <u>nan 250 Lin Ft.</u> \$21.00 2016	\$13.30		2008	\$18.70 2016	\$12.02
Curb &	2003 2002 Gutter F 2007 2006 2005	\$4.50 \$4.50 Replacement \$19.68 \$23.50 \$22.50	2012 2013 <b>Per For</b> <u>Less TH</u> 2008 2009	\$5.25 \$3.40 ot <u>nan 250 Lin Ft.</u> \$21.00 2016 \$16.98	\$13.30		2008 2009	\$18.70 2016 \$13.87	\$12.02
Curb &	2003 2002 Gutter F 2007 2006 2005 2004	\$4.50 \$4.50 Replacement \$19.68 \$23.50 \$22.50 \$22.50	2012 2013 <b>Per For</b> 2008 2009 2010	\$5.25 \$3.40 ot <u>aan 250 Lin Ft.</u> \$21.00 2016 \$16.98 \$15.10	\$13.30		2008 2009 2010	\$18.70 2016 \$13.87 \$12.30	\$12.02
Curb &	2003 2002 Gutter F 2007 2006 2005 2004 2003	\$4.50 \$4.50 Replacement \$19.68 \$23.50 \$22.50 \$22.50 No Bid	2012 2013 <b>Per For</b> 2008 2009 2010 2011	\$5.25 \$3.40 ot 250 Lin Ft. \$21.00 2016 \$16.98 \$15.10 \$18.00	\$13.30		2008 2009 2010 2011	\$18.70 2016 \$13.87 \$12.30 \$13.00	\$12.02
Curb &	2003 2002 Gutter F 2007 2006 2005 2004	\$4.50 \$4.50 Replacement \$19.68 \$23.50 \$22.50 \$22.50	2012 2013 <b>Per For</b> 2008 2009 2010 2011 2012	\$5.25 \$3.40 ot \$21.00 2016 \$16.98 \$15.10 \$18.00 \$25.25	\$13.30		2008 2009 2010 2011 2012	\$18.70 2016 \$13.87 \$12.30 \$13.00 \$19.50	\$12.02
Curb &	2003 2002 Gutter F 2007 2006 2005 2004 2003	\$4.50 \$4.50 Replacement \$19.68 \$23.50 \$22.50 \$22.50 No Bid	2012 2013 <b>Per For</b> 2008 2009 2010 2011 2012 2013	\$5.25 \$3.40 ot han 250 Lin Ft. \$21.00 2016 \$16.98 \$15.10 \$18.00 \$25.25 \$20.00	\$13.30		2008 2009 2010 2011 2012 2013	\$18.70 2016 \$13.87 \$12.30 \$13.00 \$19.50 \$15.50	\$12.02
Curb &	2003 2002 Gutter F 2007 2006 2005 2004 2003	\$4.50 \$4.50 Replacement \$19.68 \$23.50 \$22.50 \$22.50 No Bid	2012 2013 <b>Per For</b> 2008 2009 2010 2011 2012 2013 2014	\$5.25 \$3.40 ot han 250 Lin Ft. \$21.00 2016 \$16.98 \$15.10 \$18.00 \$25.25 \$20.00 \$17.80	\$13.30		2008 2009 2010 2011 2012 2013 2014	\$18.70 2016 \$13.87 \$12.30 \$13.00 \$19.50 \$15.50 \$13.75	\$12.02
Curb &	2003 2002 Gutter F 2007 2006 2005 2004 2003	\$4.50 \$4.50 Replacement \$19.68 \$23.50 \$22.50 \$22.50 No Bid	2012 2013 <b>Per For</b> 2008 2009 2010 2011 2012 2013	\$5.25 \$3.40 ot han 250 Lin Ft. \$21.00 2016 \$16.98 \$15.10 \$18.00 \$25.25 \$20.00	\$13.30		2008 2009 2010 2011 2012 2013	\$18.70 2016 \$13.87 \$12.30 \$13.00 \$19.50 \$15.50	\$12.02
	2003 2002 Gutter F 2007 2006 2005 2004 2003 2002	\$4.50 \$4.50 Replacement \$19.68 \$23.50 \$22.50 \$22.50 No Bid	2012 2013 <b>Per For</b> 2008 2009 2010 2011 2012 2013 2014	\$5.25 \$3.40 ot 2016 \$16.98 \$15.10 \$18.00 \$25.25 \$20.00 \$17.80 \$14.00	\$13.30		2008 2009 2010 2011 2012 2013 2014	\$18.70 2016 \$13.87 \$12.30 \$13.00 \$19.50 \$15.50 \$13.75	\$12.02
	2003 2002 Gutter F 2007 2006 2005 2004 2003 2002 te Slab I	\$4.50 \$4.50 Replacement \$19.68 \$23.50 \$22.50 \$22.50 No Bid \$23.00	2012 2013 Per For 2008 2009 2010 2011 2012 2013 2014 2015 Per Sq.	\$5.25 \$3.40 pt <u>han 250 Lin Ft.</u> \$21.00 2016 \$16.98 \$15.10 \$18.00 \$25.25 \$20.00 \$17.80 \$14.00 <b>. Ft.</b>		\$2.50	2008 2009 2010 2011 2012 2013 2014	\$18.70 2016 \$13.87 \$12.30 \$13.00 \$19.50 \$15.50 \$13.75	\$12.02
	2003 2002 Gutter F 2007 2006 2005 2004 2003 2002 te Slab I 2007	\$4.50 \$4.50 Replacement \$19.68 \$23.50 \$22.50 \$22.50 No Bid \$23.00 Replacement \$4.45	2012 2013 Per For 2008 2009 2010 2011 2012 2013 2014 2015 Per Sq. 2008	\$5.25 \$3.40 pt pan 250 Lin Ft. \$21.00 2016 \$16.98 \$15.10 \$18.00 \$25.25 \$20.00 \$17.80 \$14.00 . Ft. \$4.25	2014	\$2.59	2008 2009 2010 2011 2012 2013 2014	\$18.70 2016 \$13.87 \$12.30 \$13.00 \$19.50 \$15.50 \$13.75	\$12.02
	2003 2002 Gutter F 2007 2006 2005 2004 2003 2002 te Slab I 2007 2006	\$4.50 \$4.50 Replacement \$19.68 \$23.50 \$22.50 \$22.50 No Bid \$23.00 Replacement \$4.45 \$4.60	2012 2013 Per For 2008 2009 2010 2011 2012 2013 2014 2015 Per Sq. 2008 2009	\$5.25 \$3.40 pt pan 250 Lin Ft. \$21.00 2016 \$16.98 \$15.10 \$18.00 \$25.25 \$20.00 \$17.80 \$14.00 <b>. Ft.</b> \$4.25 \$3.85	2014 2015	\$2.38	2008 2009 2010 2011 2012 2013 2014	\$18.70 2016 \$13.87 \$12.30 \$13.00 \$19.50 \$15.50 \$13.75	\$12.02
	2003 2002 Gutter F 2007 2006 2005 2004 2003 2002 te Slab I 2007 2006 2005	\$4.50 \$4.50 Replacement \$19.68 \$23.50 \$22.50 \$22.50 No Bid \$23.00 Replacement \$4.45 \$4.60 \$4.20.	2012 2013 Per For 2008 2009 2010 2011 2012 2013 2014 2015 Per Sq. 2008 2009 2010	\$5.25 \$3.40 pt pan 250 Lin Ft. \$21.00 2016 \$16.98 \$15.10 \$18.00 \$25.25 \$20.00 \$17.80 \$14.00 <b>. Ft.</b> \$4.25 \$3.85 \$3.40	2014		2008 2009 2010 2011 2012 2013 2014	\$18.70 2016 \$13.87 \$12.30 \$13.00 \$19.50 \$15.50 \$13.75	\$12.02
	2003 2002 Gutter F 2007 2006 2005 2004 2003 2002 te Slab I 2007 2006 2005 2004	\$4.50 \$4.50 Replacement \$19.68 \$23.50 \$22.50 \$22.50 No Bid \$23.00 Replacement \$4.45 \$4.60 \$4.20. \$3.90	2012 2013 Per For 2008 2009 2010 2011 2012 2013 2014 2015 Per Sq. 2008 2009 2010 2011	\$5.25 \$3.40 pt pan 250 Lin Ft. \$21.00 2016 \$16.98 \$15.10 \$18.00 \$25.25 \$20.00 \$17.80 \$14.00 <b>Ft.</b> \$4.25 \$3.85 \$3.40 \$3.29	2014 2015	\$2.38	2008 2009 2010 2011 2012 2013 2014	\$18.70 2016 \$13.87 \$12.30 \$13.00 \$19.50 \$15.50 \$13.75	\$12.02
	2003 2002 Gutter F 2007 2006 2005 2004 2003 2002 te Slab I 2007 2006 2005 2004 2005 2004 2003	\$4.50 \$4.50 Replacement \$19.68 \$23.50 \$22.50 \$22.50 No Bid \$23.00 Replacement \$4.45 \$4.60 \$4.20. \$3.90 No Bid	2012 2013 Per For 2008 2009 2010 2011 2012 2013 2014 2015 Per Sq. 2008 2009 2010 2011 2012	\$5.25 \$3.40 pt han 250 Lin Ft. \$21.00 2016 \$16.98 \$15.10 \$18.00 \$25.25 \$20.00 \$17.80 \$14.00 <b>. Ft.</b> \$4.25 \$3.85 \$3.40 \$3.29 \$4.40	2014 2015	\$2.38	2008 2009 2010 2011 2012 2013 2014	\$18.70 2016 \$13.87 \$12.30 \$13.00 \$19.50 \$15.50 \$13.75	\$12.02
	2003 2002 Gutter F 2007 2006 2005 2004 2003 2002 te Slab I 2007 2006 2005 2004	\$4.50 \$4.50 Replacement \$19.68 \$23.50 \$22.50 \$22.50 No Bid \$23.00 Replacement \$4.45 \$4.60 \$4.20. \$3.90	2012 2013 Per For 2008 2009 2010 2011 2012 2013 2014 2015 Per Sq. 2008 2009 2010 2011	\$5.25 \$3.40 pt pan 250 Lin Ft. \$21.00 2016 \$16.98 \$15.10 \$18.00 \$25.25 \$20.00 \$17.80 \$14.00 <b>Ft.</b> \$4.25 \$3.85 \$3.40 \$3.29	2014 2015	\$2.38	2008 2009 2010 2011 2012 2013 2014	\$18.70 2016 \$13.87 \$12.30 \$13.00 \$19.50 \$15.50 \$13.75	\$12.02
Concre	2003 2002 Gutter F 2007 2006 2005 2004 2003 2002 te Slab I 2007 2006 2005 2004 2005 2004 2003	\$4.50 \$4.50 Replacement \$19.68 \$23.50 \$22.50 \$22.50 No Bid \$23.00 Replacement \$4.45 \$4.60 \$4.20. \$3.90 No Bid \$5.10	2012 2013 Per For 2008 2009 2010 2011 2012 2013 2014 2015 Per Sq. 2008 2009 2010 2011 2012	\$5.25 \$3.40 pt han 250 Lin Ft. \$21.00 2016 \$16.98 \$15.10 \$18.00 \$25.25 \$20.00 \$17.80 \$14.00 <b>. Ft.</b> \$4.25 \$3.85 \$3.40 \$3.29 \$4.40	2014 2015	\$2.38	2008 2009 2010 2011 2012 2013 2014	\$18.70 2016 \$13.87 \$12.30 \$13.00 \$19.50 \$15.50 \$13.75	\$12.02
Concre	2003 2002 Gutter F 2007 2006 2005 2004 2003 2002 te Slab I 2007 2006 2005 2004 2005 2004 2003 2002	\$4.50 \$4.50 Replacement \$19.68 \$23.50 \$22.50 \$22.50 No Bid \$23.00 Replacement \$4.45 \$4.60 \$4.20, \$3.90 No Bid \$5.10 nings	2012 2013 Per For 2008 2009 2010 2011 2012 2013 2014 2015 Per Sq. 2008 2009 2010 2011 2012 2013	\$5.25 \$3.40 pt han 250 Lin Ft. \$21.00 2016 \$16.98 \$15.10 \$18.00 \$25.25 \$20.00 \$17.80 \$14.00 • Ft. \$4.25 \$3.85 \$3.40 \$3.29 \$4.40 \$2.92	2014 2015 2016	\$2.38 \$2.10	2008 2009 2010 2011 2012 2013 2014	\$18.70 2016 \$13.87 \$12.30 \$13.00 \$19.50 \$15.50 \$13.75	\$12.02
Concre	2003 2002 Gutter F 2007 2006 2005 2004 2003 2002 te Slab I 2007 2006 2005 2004 2005 2004 2003 2002 te Slab I 2007 2006 2005 2004 2005 2005	\$4.50 \$4.50 Replacement \$19.68 \$23.50 \$22.50 \$22.50 No Bid \$23.00 Replacement \$4.45 \$4.60 \$4.20, \$3.90 No Bid \$5.10 nings \$ 60.00	2012 2013 Per For 2008 2009 2010 2011 2012 2013 2014 2015 Per Sq. 2008 2009 2010 2011 2012 2013	\$5.25 \$3.40 pt han 250 Lin Ft. \$21.00 2016 \$16.98 \$15.10 \$18.00 \$25.25 \$20.00 \$17.80 \$14.00 • Ft. \$4.25 \$3.85 \$3.40 \$3.29 \$4.40 \$2.92 \$50.00	2014 2015 2016 2015	\$2.38 \$2.10 \$99.00	2008 2009 2010 2011 2012 2013 2014	\$18.70 2016 \$13.87 \$12.30 \$13.00 \$19.50 \$15.50 \$13.75	\$12.02
Concre	2003 2002 Gutter F 2007 2006 2005 2004 2003 2002 te Slab I 2007 2006 2005 2004 2005 2004 2003 2002	\$4.50 \$4.50 Replacement \$19.68 \$23.50 \$22.50 \$22.50 No Bid \$23.00 Replacement \$4.45 \$4.60 \$4.20, \$3.90 No Bid \$5.10 nings	2012 2013 Per For 2008 2009 2010 2011 2012 2013 2014 2015 Per Sq. 2008 2009 2010 2011 2012 2013	\$5.25 \$3.40 pt han 250 Lin Ft. \$21.00 2016 \$16.98 \$15.10 \$18.00 \$25.25 \$20.00 \$17.80 \$14.00 • Ft. \$4.25 \$3.85 \$3.40 \$3.29 \$4.40 \$2.92	2014 2015 2016	\$2.38 \$2.10	2008 2009 2010 2011 2012 2013 2014	\$18.70 2016 \$13.87 \$12.30 \$13.00 \$19.50 \$15.50 \$13.75	\$12.02

H:\SHARE\Public Works\PROJECTS\SIDEWALK REPLACEMENT PROGRAM\2016 SIDEWALK REPLACEMENT\REPLACEMENT COSTS 2002-2016.doc